

**CITY OF PINOLE  
PINOLE-HERCULES WATER POLLUTION CONTROL PLANT UPGRADE PROJECT**

**BID RESULTS**

ITEM	Description	Unit	Quantity	Overaa Construction	Kiewit	Monterey Mechanical	Western Water Constructors	Shimmick Construction	Walsh Construction	Flatiron Corporation	WM Lyles
Bid Item 1	Mobilization and Demobilization	1	LS	\$ 1,000,000.00	\$ 4,200,000.00						
Bid Item 2	Sheeting, shoring & bracing or equivalent method conforming to appl. safety orders	1	LS	\$ 3,500,000.00	\$ 1,200,000.00						
Bid Item 3	Headworks Facility	1	LS	\$ 2,500,000.00	\$ 4,800,000.00						
Bid Item 4	Electrical and Controls	1	LS	\$ 8,000,000.00	\$ 3,000,000.00						
Bid Item 5	Secondary Treatment	1	LS	\$ 3,000,000.00	\$ 13,225,000.00						
Bid Item 6	Chlorine Disinfection	1	LS	\$ 1,000,000.00	\$ 6,000,000.00						
Bid Item 7	Effluent Pump Station	1	LS	\$ 1,500,000.00	\$ 3,000,000.00						
Bid Item 8	Solids Handling	1	LS	\$ 3,000,000.00	\$ 6,000,000.00						
Bid Item 9	Outfall	1	LS	\$ 1,500,000.00	\$ 40,000.00						
Bid Item 10	All other work as indicated on project plans & defined in the project specifications	1	LS	\$ 23,558,000.00	\$ 1,500,000.00						
Total				\$ 48,558,000.00	\$ 42,965,000.00	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid	No bid
				\$ 48,558,000.00	\$ 178,000.00	Contractor insurance adder to meet contract requirements					
				\$ 48,558,000.00	\$ 43,143,000.00						